
Johnson County Park & Recreation District 
BID TABULATION SHEET 

FOR BEVERAGE PRODUCTS, EQUIPMENT, AND SUPPLIES 
Bid Opening Monday, December 6, 2010 at 2 PM  

 JCPRD Administration Building Boardroom 
 

1 

Item No. 1 1a  2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1b 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1c 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1d 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1e 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

Company  

Coca-Cola 
Bottling of Mid-
America, Inc. 

$7.50  
per case of 24 

5% $7.50  
per case of 24 

5% $13.50  
per case of 24 

5% $10.00 
per case of 24 

5% $17.00 
per case of 24 

5% 

Pepsi-Cola 
General Bottlers, 
Inc. 

$7.15  
per case of 24 

No more than 
4% 

$8.00  
per case of 24 

No more than 
4% 

$12.50  
per case of 24 

No more than 
4% 

$9.24  
per case of 24 

No more than 
4% 

$22.67  
per case of 24 

No more than 
4% 

Seven-
Up/Snapple 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

$___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 

Other 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

$___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 

Supt. Estimate $8.00  
per case of 24 

5% $8.00  
per case of 24 

5% $14.00  
per case of 24 

5% $13.00 
per case of 24 

5% $17.00  
per case of 24 

5% 
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Item No. 1 
Product 

Specifications 

1f  2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1g 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1h 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1i 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1j 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

Company  

Coca-Cola 
Bottling of Mid-
America, Inc. 

$___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 

Pepsi-Cola 
General Bottlers, 
Inc. 

$___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 

Seven-
Up/Snapple 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

$___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 

Other 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

$___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 

Supt. Estimate $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 

 $___________  
per case of 24 
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Item No. 1 
Product 

Specifications 

1k  2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1l 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1m 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1n 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1o 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

Company  

Coca-Cola 
Bottling of Mid-
America, Inc. 

$___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per BIB 

 $___________  
per BIB 

 $___________  
per canister 

 

Pepsi-Cola 
General Bottlers, 
Inc. 

$___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per BIB 

 $___________  
per BIB 

 $___________  
per canister 

 

Seven-
Up/Snapple 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

$___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per BIB 

 $___________  
per BIB 

 $___________  
per canister 

 

Other 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

$___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per BIB 

 $___________  
per BIB 

 $___________  
per canister 

 

Supt. Estimate $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per BIB 

 $___________  
per BIB 

 $___________  
per canister 
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Item No. 1 
Product 

Specifications 

1p  2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1q 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1r 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1s 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1t 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

Company  

Coca-Cola 
Bottling of Mid-
America, Inc. 

$___________  
per lb. 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 

Pepsi-Cola 
General Bottlers, 
Inc. 

$___________  
per lb. 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 

Seven-
Up/Snapple 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

$___________  
per lb. 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 

Other 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

$___________  
per lb. 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 

Supt. Estimate $___________  
per lb. 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 
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Item No. 1 
Product 

Specifications 

1u  2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1v 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1w 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

1x 2012-2015 
Annual 

Inflationary 
Adj. % (if any) 

Company  

Coca-Cola 
Bottling of Mid-
America, Inc. 

$___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 

Pepsi-Cola 
General Bottlers, 
Inc. 

$___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 

Seven-
Up/Snapple 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

$___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 

Other 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

$___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 

Supt. Estimate $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 

 $___________  
per case of 
____ 
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Item No. 2 
Product 

Equipment 
Specifications 

 
 

Company  

Coca-Cola 
Bottling of Mid-
America, Inc. 

 
______ CHECK TO CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE 

Pepsi-Cola 
General 

Bottlers, Inc. 

 
______ CHECK TO CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE 

Seven-
Up/Snapple 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

 
______ CHECK TO CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE 

Other 
NO BID 

SUBMITTED 

 
______ CHECK TO CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE 

Supt. Estimate  
______ CHECK TO CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE 
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Item No. 3 
Vending 

Equipment 
Specifications 

 
 

Company  

Coca-Cola 
Bottling of Mid-
America, Inc. 

 
______ CHECK TO CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE 

Pepsi-Cola 
General 

Bottlers, Inc. 

 
______ CHECK TO CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE 

Seven-
Up/Snapple 

NO BID 
SUBMITTED 

 
______ CHECK TO CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE 

Other 
NO BID 

SUBMITTED 

 
______ CHECK TO CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE 

Supt. Estimate  
______ CHECK TO CONFIRM ACCEPTANCE 
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Item No. 4 Donated 
Product 

Specifications for 
District Special 

Events 

1) Product as 
requested  

2) Monetary donation in lieu 
of product (specify dollar 
amount) 

Company  

Coca-Cola Bottling of 
Mid-America, Inc. 

 

_____Yes  _____No 

 

$___________________ 

Pepsi-Cola General 
Bottlers, Inc. 

 

_____Yes  _____No 

 

$___________________ 

Seven-Up/Snapple 
NO BID SUBMITTED 

 

_____Yes  _____No 

 

$___________________ 

Other 
NO BID SUBMITTED 

 

_____Yes  _____No 

 

$___________________ 

Supt. Estimate 
 

_____Yes  _____No 

 

$___________________ 
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Item No. 5 
Sponsorship & 

Advertising 
Specifications 

   

Company  

Coca-Cola Bottling of 
Mid-America, Inc. 

 
2011 Sponsorship 
Allocation 
 
$____________ 

 
2012-2015 Allocation 
(per year) 
 
$_____________ 

 
Total Sponsorship Allocation 
  
 
$_____________ 

Pepsi-Cola General 
Bottlers, Inc. 

 
2011 Sponsorship 
Allocation 
 
$____________ 

 
2012-2015 Allocation 
(per year) 
 
$_____________ 

 
Total Sponsorship Allocation 
  
 
$_____________ 

Seven-Up/Snapple 
NO BID SUBMITTED 

 
2011 Sponsorship 
Allocation 
 
$____________ 

 
2012-2015 Allocation 
(per year) 
 
$_____________ 

 
Total Sponsorship Allocation 
  
 
$_____________ 

Seven-Up/Snapple 
NO BID SUBMITTED 

 
2011 Sponsorship 
Allocation 
 
$____________ 

 
2012-2015 Allocation 
(per year) 
 
$_____________ 

 
Total Sponsorship Allocation 
  
 
$_____________ 

Supt. Estimate 
 
2011 Sponsorship 
Allocation 
 
$____________ 

 
2012-2015 Allocation 
(per year) 
 
$_____________ 

 
Total Sponsorship Allocation 
  
 
$_____________ 

 


